Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Serving

Required
Estimated Number of ’ \ Estimated Cost Number LEAD TIME Number of
N?Jtrf')n(;ker Unit Description (Mamﬁggtrg:’:grirdinc‘isca de) Servings Bidder I_?_;d”d;'e; Manl.l;fra:r:;rer S P'\c 2;?;%?;; Pack Size | Servings per per of CSZ?\t/i’:g Exteng:gtTotal Comments | FROM ORDER Cases Per
(2019-2020) Case Case Cases to (IN WEEKS) Pallet
meet need
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 17
Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, SCBE
Bid Submissions That Deviate From What PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING | will accept an approv.ed
) ) ) SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT equal (1) as long as it
Is Being Requested In The Specifications - ALL SHIP LOTS
Below Will Be Considered A Non CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK meets the bid ARE IN CASES.
A ble Vendor R SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY specification and (2)
cceptable Vendor Response. CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED. | tested and approved
through SCBE's Sample
Submission Process.
Breakfast Stick, Cheese-Filled with Blueberry |ConAgra 7738712611
Bits - Frozen. IQF. Filling to consist of low fat
mozzerella cheese mixture with vanilla and
cinnamon. Dough to consist of 51% whole
grain with cinnamon and blueberry bits. One
stick to meet 1 oz meat/meat alternate and 1 )
1002 SERVING |oz. grain equivalent for Child Nutrition 600,000 Conagra Brands [ Net 30 The Max 77387-12611 | 96/2.30 oz. 96 38.6000 6,250 0.4021 241,250.00 14 business 63
Program. Case to include ovenable bags. days
Approximate pack size 96/2.3 oz servings per
case.
Ship Lot: 200 cases
Kolache, Beef and Pork, WG - Frozen Kolache |Eddy's 2515
made from beef and pork. CN labeled.
Covered with a whole grain sweet dough.
Kolache to meet 1 meat/ meat alternate and 1 21 Day
oz. whole grain for the Child Nutrition program. Global Foods |lead time 6
1005 SERVING |Packaged in an individually wrapped ovenable 400,000 LeiChi 60826 70/ 20z 70 26.5300 5,714 0.3790 151,600.00 3 Weeks 98
. Inc. pallet
bag. Packed 60 servings per case. If packed L.
diferently,please indicate. minimum
Ship Lot: 300
Kolache, Beef and Pork, WG - Frozen Kolache |Eddy's 2515
made from beef and pork. CN labeled.
Covered with a whole grain sweet dough.
Kolache to meet 1 meat/ meat alternate and 1
oz. whole grain for the Child Nutrition program.
1005 SERVING |Packaged in an individually wrapped ovenable 400,000 Eddy Packing |Net 7 Days Kolache 2515 60 IW 60 23.9300 6,667 0.3988 159,533.33 Two Weeks 60
bag. Packed 60 servings per case. If packed
diferently,please indicate.
Ship Lot: 300




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Serving

1005

SERVING

Kolache, Beef and Pork, WG - Frozen Kolache
made from beef and pork. CN labeled.

Covered with a whole grain sweet dough.
Kolache to meet 1 meat/ meat alternate and 1
oz. whole grain for the Child Nutrition program.
Packaged in an individually wrapped ovenable
bag. Packed 60 servings per case. If packed
diferently,please indicate.

Ship Lot: 300

Eddy's 2515

400,000

SYsco NET

MEMPHIS,LLC 14DAYS EDDY PACKING 2515 60/20Z

60

24.6500

6,667

0.4108

164,333.33

3 WEEKS

60 CS

1005

SERVING

Kolache, Beef and Pork, WG - Frozen Kolache
made from beef and pork. CN labeled.

Covered with a whole grain sweet dough.
Kolache to meet 1 meat/ meat alternate and 1
oz. whole grain for the Child Nutrition program.
Packaged in an individually wrapped ovenable
bag. Packed 60 servings per case. If packed
diferently,please indicate.

Ship Lot: 300

Eddy's 2515

400,000

US Foods EOM 10 Eddy's 2515 1593029 60/2 oz

60

25.5800

6,667

0.4263

170,533.33

3 WEEKS

60

1006

SERVING

Ribs, BBQ - Smoked BBQ St. Louis styled ribs.
No sauce added, dry rub. Each serving must
equal a minimum of 2 oz. of meat/meat
alternate. Packed in whole slabs, 8/1.6 Ibs.
cryovac bags per case.

Ship Lot: 25

Brookwood Farms 17505

30,000

Brookwood
US Foods EOM 10 Farms 9484230 8/1.6 LBA
17505

48

67.8400

625

1.4133

42,400.00

Product is
sold as price
per pound.
Case price
quoted is
$5.30 per Ib. x
12.8 Ib case

3 WEEKS

135

1006

SERVING

Ribs, BBQ - Smoked BBQ St. Louis styled ribs.
No sauce added, dry rub. Each serving must
equal a minimum of 2 oz. of meat/meat
alternate. Packed in whole slabs, 8/1.6 Ibs.
cryovac bags per case.

Ship Lot: 25

Brookwood Farms 17505

30,000

SYsco NET

MEMPHIS,LLC | 14DAys | BROOKWOOD 17505 144

48

76.3000

625

1.5896

47,687.50

3 WEEKS

135Cs

1024

SERVING

Salad Bowl/Shell, 9"- Made from whole
ultra grain flour. Low sodium. To be
baked in a non stick salad shell pan to
create shape of shell. Shell must meet a
minimum of 2 oz. equivalent grain for the
Child Nutrition Program. Packed in 16/12
ct. packages per case.

Ship Lot: 25

Azteca 06909

52,800

SYSCO

MEMPHIS, LLC NET 14DAYS AZTECA 6909 24/6CT

144

34.5700

367

0.2401

12,675.67

2 WEEKS

42Cs

1024

SERVING

Salad Bowl/Shell, 9"- Made from whole
ultra grain flour. Low sodium. To be
baked in a non stick salad shell pan to
create shape of shell. Shell must meet a
minimum of 2 oz. equivalent grain for the
Child Nutrition Program. Packed in 16/12
ct. packages per case.

Ship Lot: 25

Azteca 06909

52,800

Azt 91619
US Foods EoM10 | Zreed 1247258 24/6 Ea
per the vendor

144

36.3500

367

0.2524

13,328.33

3 WEEKS

42




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Serving

1085

SERVING

Vegetarian Pinwheel - Individually
wrapped, whole grain vegetable pinwheel
made with USDA commodity cheese, code
110244. To contain Cheese, broccoli and
spinach. Each serving to meet 2 oz.
meat/meat alternate, 1/8 c. dark green
vegetable and and an minimum of 2.0 oz
equivalent grains for the Child Nutrition
Program.

Ship Lot: 200

ES Foods 25417

112,608

ES Foods NET 30 ES Foods 25417

96/4.56 oz

96

56.6300

1,173

0.5899

66,426.99

Our case price
here is Fee For
Service
Commodity
Price. For
commodity
draw down
info, please
refer to
attached
SEPDS

2 weeks

48

1090

SERVING

Cookies, Chocolate Chip - Frozen cookie
dough puck to be baked in oven. Cookie
must meet Smart Snack guidelines for the
School Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 50

No Approved Brands

100,000

Bake Crafters
Food Company

Bake Crafters Net 14

2269
Food Company Days

320/1oz

320

26.2400

313

0.0820

$

2,624,000

Price
requires a 90
case
minimum
order

2 Weeks or 14
Days

90

1090

SERVING

Cookies, Chocolate Chip - Frozen cookie
dough puck to be baked in oven. Cookie
must meet Smart Snack guidelines for the
School Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 50

No Approved Brands

100,000

SYsco
MEMPHIS,LLC

NET 14DAYS| BAKECRAFTERS 2269

320/10Z

320

28.6800

313

0.0896

8,962.50

2 WEEKS

90CS

1090

SERVING

Cookies, Chocolate Chip - Frozen cookie
dough puck to be baked in oven. Cookie
must meet Smart Snack guidelines for the
School Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 50

No Approved Brands

100,000

21 Day Lead

Global Foods Time 1
Inc. Pallet

Minimum

JSB Muffintown 56191

392/ 10z

392

39.4900

0.1007

10,073.98

3 Weeks

110

1090

SERVING

Cookies, Chocolate Chip - Frozen cookie
dough puck to be baked in oven. Cookie
must meet Smart Snack guidelines for the
School Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 50

No Approved Brands

100,000

Aryzta

US Foods 21649

EOM 10 5753775

180/1.85 oz

180

39.9300

556

0.2218

22,183.33

3 WEEKS

84

1090

SERVING

Cookies, Chocolate Chip - Frozen cookie
dough puck to be baked in oven. Cookie
must meet Smart Snack guidelines for the
School Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 50

No Approved Brands

100,000

SIDE DISH 5 NET 30 SIDE DISH 5 VCCC-8728

320

160

72.0000

625

0.4500

45,000.00




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Serving

1163

SERVING

Fruit Juice Pearls - Frozen, Tropical fruit pieces
(pearls). Packaged in individual frozen cups,
dairy free with no sugar added. Must meet 1/2
cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 200

Fruit Pearls Tropical 882193005129

500,000

SYSCO

NET 14DAYS
MEMPHIS,LLC

CITRAPAC 5228 48/1.94

48

13.7500

10,417

0.2865

143,229.17

3 WEEKS

120Cs

1163

SERVING

Fruit Juice Pearls - Frozen,Tropical fruit pieces
(pearls). Packaged in individual frozen cups,
dairy free with no sugar added. Must meet 1/2
cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Program.

Ship Lot: 200

Fruit Pearls Tropical 882193005129

500,000

Fruit Pearls
882193005228
per the vendor

US Foods EOM 10 9707795 48/1.94 oz

48

14.2400

10,417

0.2967

148,333.33

3 WEEKS

120

1582

SERVINGS

Croissants, Whole Grain, Round, Sliced -
Frozen. Made with whole wheat flour. Weight
of 2.2 oz. or greater per croissant as stated on
product nutrition label. Entire croissant must
meet a minimum of 2 oz Grain Equivalents for
the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate
Pack: 150 servings per case.

Ship
Lot: 250 cases

BAKE CRAFTERS (3286)
East Baking Company 8010

43,200

Hadley Farms, Inc. | Net 14 Days [Hadley Farms, Inc. 139 144/2.20z.

144

32.0500

300

0.2226

9,615.00

3 Pallet
Minimum

2 Weeks

30

1582

SERVINGS

Croissants, Whole Grain, Round, Sliced -
Frozen. Made with whole wheat flour. Weight
of 2.2 oz. or greater per croissant as stated on
product nutrition label. Entire croissant must
meet a minimum of 2 oz Grain Equivalents for
the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate
Pack: 150 servings per case.

Ship
Lot: 250 cases

BAKE CRAFTERS (3286)
East Baking Company 8010

43,200

Bake Crafters
Food Company

Net 14 Days| Dake Crafters 3286

80/2.20:
Food Company / ?

80

21.6800

540

0.2710

936,576.00

Price requires a
minimum 4
pallet order of
3286.

2 Weeks or 14
days

48

1582

SERVINGS

Croissants, Whole Grain, Round, Sliced -
Frozen. Made with whole wheat flour. Weight
of 2.2 oz. or greater per croissant as stated on
product nutrition label. Entire croissant must
meet a minimum of 2 oz Grain Equivalents for
the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate
Pack: 150 servings per case.

Ship
Lot: 250 cases

BAKE CRAFTERS (3286)
East Baking Company 8010

43,200

SYSCo
MEMPHIS,LLC

NET 14DAYS| BAKECRAFTERS 3286 80/2.502

80

23.7500

540

0.2969

12,825.00

3 WEEKS

48CS

1582

SERVINGS

Croissants, Whole Grain, Round, Sliced -
Frozen. Made with whole wheat flour. Weight
of 2.2 oz. or greater per croissant as stated on
product nutrition label. Entire croissant must
meet a minimum of 2 oz Grain Equivalents for
the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate
Pack: 150 servings per case.

Ship
Lot: 250 cases

BAKE CRAFTERS (3286)
East Baking Company 8010

43,200

US Foods EOM 10 (Saralee 41315 9651266 48/2.35 oz

48

16.8300

9200

0.3506

15,147.00

3 WEEKS

72




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Serving

Enchiladas, Pepper Jack, Frozen - Pepper Jack [Side Dish 5
Cheese Enchiladas. Each 2 oz enchilada
provides 1 oz. meat/ meat alternate and 1 oz.
grain equivalent towards the NSLP. Whole n
Grain Rich Corn Tortilla. Must provide CN M.C.I. Foods, Mlnlmum
2008 SERVINGS labeled and/or product formulation sheet. 1,500,000 Inc. Net 30 Days Los Cabos 64150 144 144 53.2600 10,417 0.3699 554,791.67 shipment 264 21 days 66
Enchiladas are bulk packed. Cases)
Ship Lot 300
Enchiladas, Pepper Jack, Frozen - Pepper Jack [Side Dish 5
Cheese Enchiladas. Each 2 oz enchilada
provides 1 oz. meat/ meat alternate and 1 oz.
grain equivalent towards the NSLP. Whole
Grain Rich Corn Tortilla. Must provide CN
2008 SERVINGS labeled and/or product formulation sheet 1,500,000 SIDE DISH 5 NET 30 SIDE DISH 5 WGPJE-2626 Bulk 200 135.0000 7,500 0.6750 1,012,500.00
Enchiladas are bulk packed.
Ship Lot 300
Turkey Roast - Pre-cooked, pre-seasoned. Slow |Jennie O - 215634
Roasted turkey made from thigh meat. Made
with USDA turkey 100124. No soy fillers.
Serving to provide 2 oz. meat/meat alternate SYSCo available to
2400 250,000 .5-6. . B K
SERVINGS for the Child Nutrition Program. MEMPHIS, LLC NET 14DAYS BUTTERBALL 2265589204 3/5.5-6.54 82 41.0100 3,049 0.5001 125,030.49 order 11/1/19 3 weeks 100cs
Ship Lot: 100
Turkey Roast - Pre-cooked, pre-seasoned. Slow [Jennie O - 215634 Product 1S
Roasted turkey made from thigh meat. Made sold as prldce
with USDA turkey 100124. No soy fillers. per pound.
. N Case price
Serving to provide 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Butterball quoted is
2400 SERVINGS (£5r the Child Nutrition Program. 250,000 US Foods EOM 10 2265589200 NEW# 3/6 LBA 82 41.4000 3,049 0.5049 126,219.51 $2.30 per Ib. x 3 weeks 100
18 |b case.
Ship Lot: 100 Will be
available after
Nov 1
Turkey Roast - Pre-cooked, pre-seasoned. Slow |Jennie O - 215634
Roasted turkey made from thigh meat. Made
with USDA turkey 100124. No soy fillers. -
Serving to provide 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Cargill Meat Shady Brook Our minimum
2400 SERVINGS . o 250,000 X NET30 700259 6/5 Ibs. 135 85.5000 1,852 0.6333 158,333.33 for shipping is 3 weeks 55
for the Child Nutrition Program. Solutions Farms
3,000 Ibs.
Ship Lot: 100
Turkey Roast - Pre-cooked, pre-seasoned. Slow |Jennie O - 215634 o
Roasted turkey made from thigh meat. Made Th's‘. 1s a.catch
with USDA turkey 100124. No soy fillers. weight item.
Serving to provide 2 oz. meat/meat alternate Case price is
2400 SERVINGS (¢, the Child Nutrition Program. 250,000 Jennie-O Net 10 days Jennie-O 215634 4/7-9 LB Avg. 173 113.0500 1,445 0.6535 28,262,500.00 based on 60
average case
Ship Lot: 100 weight. Price
is $3.23/LB




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Pound

Required
Estimated Number of . . Estimated Cost Number LEAD TIME Number of
Nitrtr)\‘k;)ker Unit Description (Manlﬁgstru?r\;egrg::launc‘:s(:ode) Pounds Bidder ?:;::I:sr Manu.g:;:srers F’,\fgzzfcatcéif; Pack Size Pounds per per of C:::rr]);r Exteng:xs:ltTotaI Comments | FROM ORDER Cases Per
(2019-2020) Case Case Cases to (IN WEEKS) Pallet
meet need
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 17
Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, SCBE
Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING | will accept an approv.ed
. . SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT equal (1) as long as it
Being Requested In The Specifications Below > ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN
Will Be Considered A Non Acc - CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK meets the bid CASES.
- SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY specification and (2)
Vendor Response.
CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED. tested and approved
through SCBE's Sample
Submission Process.
Chicken, Diced - Fully Cooked - 1/2" cubes, |Koch Foods (5178)
boneless, skinless, light and dark meat
chicken in natural proportions. No TVP or
other meat alternatives added. Serving must
1066 | sevigs |ProVideamin. of 2.0 0z meat/meat alternate 150,000 TYSON 14 DAYS TYSON 022830-0928 | o/ 51 10 258000 | 15,000 | 25800 | 387,000.00 2 WEEKS 144
for the Child Nutrition program. z (10228300928) . § U A b ,000.
Approximate pack: 10 Ibs case
SHIP LOT: 300 cases
Chicken, Diced - Fully Cooked - 1/2" cubes, |Koch Foods (5178)
boneless, skinless, light and dark meat
chicken in natural proportions. No TVP or
other meat alternatives added. Serving must
1066 | sevins |Provide @ min. of 2.0 oz. meat/meat alternate 150,000 US FOODS Eom 10 Tyson 8696243 2/5LB 10 263500 15,000 | 2.6350 | 395250.00 3 weeks 144
for the Child Nutrition program. ’ 10228300928 ’ ) e
Approximate pack: 10 Ibs case
SHIP LOT: 300 cases
Chicken, Diced - Fully Cooked - 1/2" cubes, |Koch Foods (5178)
boneless, skinless, light and dark meat
chicken in natural proportions. No TVP or
other meat alternatives added. Serving must
provide a min. of 2.0 oz. meat/meat alternate
1066 SERVINGS for the Child Nutrition program. 150,000 Pilgrim's Pride Corp Net 30 days Pierce 1230 6/5# Bags 30 80.9600 5,000 2.6987 404,800.00 3 56
Approximate pack: 10 Ibs case
SHIP LOT: 300 cases
Chicken, Diced - Fully Cooked - 1/2" cubes, |Koch Foods (5178)
boneless, skinless, light and dark meat
chicken in natural proportions. No TVP or
other meat alternatives added. Serving must
provide a min. of 2.0 oz. meat/meat alternate
1066 SERVINGS . . 150,000 SYSCO MEMPHIS LLC NET 14DAYS KOCH FOODS 5178 10 $10.00 29.7300 15,000 2.9730 445,950.00 2WEEKS 160CS
for the Child Nutrition program. ’ ’ 4
Approximate pack: 10 Ibs case
SHIP LOT: 300 cases




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Frozen by the Pound

1121

POUND

Eggs, Diced, Frozen - Fully cooked Egg Whites
and Egg Yolks, treated with citric acid to
prevent greening.Diced frozen whole eggs.
Uniformly cut. Bright yellow yolks with and
firm egg whites. Packed 4/5 Ib poly bags. If
packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 50

Sunny Fresh (40005)
Michaels (80457)
Michaels (46025-64102-00)

3,600

Michaels

EOM 10
US FOODS (46025-64102-00)

9159781

4/5 1B

20

33.7900

180

1.6895

6,082.20

3 weeks

81

1121

POUND

Eggs, Diced, Frozen - Fully cooked Egg Whites
and Egg Yolks, treated with citric acid to
prevent greening.Diced frozen whole eggs.
Uniformly cut. Bright yellow yolks with and
firm egg whites. Packed 4/5 Ib poly bags. If
packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 50

Sunny Fresh (40005)
Michaels (80457)
Michaels (46025-64102-00)

3,600

WHLFCLS/MICHAE
L

SYSCO MEMPHIS LLC NET 14DAYS

74865-80457

4/5#

$20.00

37.0700

180

1.8535

6,672.60

2 WEEKS

81CS

1493

POUND

Stir Fry Vegetable Blend - Frozen, should
contain broccoli florets, kernel corn, diced
red peppers, shelled edamame and
matchstick carrots.

Approximate Packed 6/2.5 Ib. pkgs./case.

Ship Lot: 100

Simplot 10071179607762

300,000

Simplot Simple

J. R. Simplot 2% 10 Goodness

607762

6/2.5#

15

24.0000

20,000

1.6000

480,000.00

7 days

80

1493

POUND

Stir Fry Vegetable Blend - Frozen, should
contain broccoli florets, kernel corn, diced
red peppers, shelled edamame and
matchstick carrots.

Approximate Packed 6/2.5 Ib. pkgs./case.

Ship Lot: 100

Simplot 10071179607762

300,000

SYSCO MEMPHIS LLC NET 14DAYS SIMPLOT

9607762

6/2.54

$15.00

25.3500

20,000

1.6900

507,000.00

3 WEEKS

80CS

1495

POUND

Carrots, Baby, Frozen - Packed to U.S. Grade
A standards. Carrots should be bright in color
and uniform in size.

Approximate Pack: 384 serving in a 20 |bs per
case.

SHIP LOT: 300

Flav R Pac 11975

100,000

SYSCO MEMPHIS LLC NET 14DAYS FLAVOR PAC

11975

20#

20

16.9000

5,000

0.8450

84,500.00

2 WEEKS

90Cs

1495

POUND

Carrots, Baby, Frozen - Packed to U.S. Grade
A standards. Carrots should be bright in color
and uniform in size.

Approximate Pack: 384 serving in a 20 Ibs per
case.

SHIP LOT: 300

Flav R Pac 11975

100,000

US FOODS EOM 10 Flav R Pac 11975

3018363

20 Lb

20

21.4300

5,000

1.0715

107,150.00

3 weeks

90




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Dry by the Serving
Required
. . . . Estimated Cost Number LEAD TIME FROM Number of
oy | S| gy | S| s | Mol | sy | soumsrm | g | o | Snper | SOeama | o omen | e
Case Case Cases to 9 (IN WEEKS) Pallet
meet need
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 17
It listed are Pre-A d
, - , PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING ems listed are Pre-Approve
Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Brands, SCBE will accept an
q " . SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT q
Being Requested In The Specifications Below AT, /20 A SIS T o approved equal (1) as long as it ALL SHIP LOTS
Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor . meets the bid specification and (2) | ARE IN CASES.
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND .
Response. tested and approved through SCBE's
EVALUATED. .
Sample Submission Process.
Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple Cinnamon National Food Group 60460-BR1330
Flavored - Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar Fieldstone 09797
made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar |General Mills 16000-19437-0
that meets 1 oz. grain equivalent serving for  |Kellogg's 48396
1030 SEvNEs et Aoy pegEm, Ao |l A 250,000 NFG NET 30 NFG/Zee Zees B60460 160/1.30z. 160 29.2500 1,563 01828 45,703.13 14 days 105
pack: 160/1.30z servings per case.
Ship Lot: 200
Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple Cinnamon National Food Group 60460-BR1330
Flavored - Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar Fieldstone 09797
made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar |General Mills 16000-19437-0
that meets 1 oz. grain equivalent serving for  |Kellogg's 48396
1030 SERVINGS |the child nutrition program. Approximate [Darlington Appleways 250,000 McKee Foods |\ rr 35 days RELDSIONE 9797 L8, Sl 192 39.7400 1,302 0.2070 51,744.79
pack: 160/1.30z servings per case. Corporation BAKERY PER CASE
Ship Lot: 200
Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple Cinnamon National Food Group 60460-BR1330
Flavored - Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar Fieldstone 09797
made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar [General Mills 16000-19437-0
that meets 1 oz. grain equivalent serving for  |Kellogg's 48396
o - a . Kellogg"
1030 SERVINGS |the child nutrition program. Approximate Darlington Appleways 250,000 US FOODS EOM 10 et 8690190 96/1.3 02 % 21.4500 2,604 0.2234 55,859.38 3 WEEKS 60
pack: 160/1.30z servings per case. 3800048396
Ship Lot: 200
Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple Cinnamon National Food Group 60460-BR1330
Flavored - Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar Fieldstone 09797
made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar |General Mills 16000-19437-0
that meets 1 oz. grain equivalent serving for  |Kellogg's 48396
q - A f E
1030 SERVINGS the child nutrition program. Approximate Darlington Appleways 250,000 SYSCO MEMPHIS, |\ e 1apAYS KELLOGG 48396 96/1.30Z % 21.6300 2,604 0.2253 56,328.13 2 WEEKS 60CS
pack: 160/1.30z servings per case. LLC
Ship Lot: 200
Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple Cinnamon National Food Group 60460-BR1330
Flavored - Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar Fieldstone 09797
made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar |General Mills 16000-19437-0
that meets 1 oz. grain equivalent serving for  |Kellogg's 48396
i iti i i ELD
1030 SERVINGS  |the child nutrition program. Approximate Darlington Appleways 250,000 CHURCHE! 1/2% 10NET30 |  APPLEWAYS 75100 160/ 2.4 0Z 160 57.1500 1,563 0.3572 89,296.88 2 2
pack: 160/1.30z servings per case. TRADING
Ship Lot: 200




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Dry by the Serving

1142

SERVINGS

Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry Flavored
Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar made from
whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets
1 oz. grain equivalent serving for the child
nutrition program. Approximate pack:
160/1.30z servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200

Tools for Schools 54507710
Darlington Appleways

250,000

FIELDSTONE
NET 30 days BAKERY 9767
FASTSTART BAR

McKee Foods
Corporation

192, 1.410Z
PER CASE

192

34.3600

1,302

0.1790

44,739.58

1142

SERVINGS

Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry Flavored
Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar made from
whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets
1 oz. grain equivalent serving for the child
nutrition program. Approximate pack:
160/1.30z servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200

Tools for Schools 54507710
Darlington Appleways

250,000

NFG NET 30 NFG/Zee Zees B60475

160/1.30z.

160

29.2500

1,563

0.1828

45,703.13

Product Was Approved
From Fall Food Show
(See attached letter)

14 days

105

1142

SERVINGS

Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry Flavored
Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar made from
whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets
1 oz. grain equivalent serving for the child
nutrition program. Approximate pack:
160/1.30z servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200

Tools for Schools 54507710
Darlington Appleways

250,000

SYSCO MEMPHIS,

LLc NET 14DAYS

APPLEWAYS 70400

216/1.20Z

216

41.2000

1,157

0.1907

47,685.19

3 WEEKS

48Cs

1142

SERVINGS

Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry Flavored
Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar made from
whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets
1 oz. grain equivalent serving for the child
nutrition program. Approximate pack:
160/1.30z servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200

Tools for Schools 54507710
Darlington Appleways

250,000

Kellogg's

US FOODS EOM 10 3800059772

2691491

96/1.55 0Z

96

23.0900

2,604

0.2405

60,130.21

3 WEEKS

72

1142

SERVINGS

Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry Flavored
Minimum of 1.25 oz. Cereal bar made from
whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets
1 oz. grain equivalent serving for the child
nutrition program. Approximate pack:
160/1.30z servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200

Tools for Schools 54507710
Darlington Appleways

250,000

CHURCHFIELD

9
TRADING 1/2% 10NET30 APPLEWAYS 75400

160/ 2.4 0Z

160

57.1500

1,563

0.3572

89,296.88

42

1322

SERVINGS

Chips, Tortilla, Hot- Whole grain reduced fat
hot tortilla chips with a hint of lime. Smart
snack compliant for the Child Nutrition
Program. To meet a minimum of 1 oz. grain
equivalent. Packed 72/case. If packed
diffferently, please indicate.

Shin Lot: 50

Doritos Flamas 62829

50,400

SYSCO MEMPHIS,
LLC

NET 14DAYS FRITO LAY 62829

72/10z2

72

20.5000

700

0.2847

14,350.00

2 WEEKS

36CS

1322

SERVINGS

Chips, Tortilla, Hot- Whole grain reduced fat
hot tortilla chips with a hint of lime. Smart
snack compliant for the Child Nutrition
Program. To meet a minimum of 1 oz. grain
equivalent. Packed 72/case. If packed
diffferently, please indicate.

Shin Lot: 50

Doritos Flamas 62829

50,400

Doritos Flamas
US FOODS EOM 10 9584141
62829

72/10z

72

20.9100

700

0.2904

14,637.00

3 WEEKS

36




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Dry by the Serving

1562

SERVINGS

Popcorn, Butter flavored - Reduced Fat,
popped. Must meet the Smart Snack
Guidelines for School Nutrition Programs.
Packed 96/case. If packed differently, please
indicate.

Ship Lot: 50 cs.

No approved brands

75,000

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1563

SERVINGS

Popcorn, Cheese flavored -Reduced fat,
popped. Must meet a minimum of 1 oz.
Product must meet Smart Snack Guidelines for
School Nutrition Programs. Packed 96/case.
If packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 20

No approved brands

100,000

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1564

SERVINGS

Crispy Rice Bar, Individual. Crispy
marshmallow squares made from puffed, oven
roasted rice cereal. Must meet 1 oz grain
equivalent for the child nutrition program.
Approximate Pack: 72/case.

Ship Lot: 100 cases

Kellogg's 3800011052

80,000

Kellogg's

US FOODS EOM 10 3800011052

8733560

80/1.41 0z

80

26.4500

1,000

0.3306

26,450.00

3 WEEKS

60

1564

SERVINGS

Crispy Rice Bar, Individual. Crispy
marshmallow squares made from puffed, oven
roasted rice cereal. Must meet 1 oz grain
equivalent for the child nutrition program.
Approximate Pack: 72/case.

Ship Lot: 100 cases

Kellogg's 3800011052

80,000

SYSCO MEMPHIS,
LLC

NET 14DAYS KELLOGG

11052

80/1.410Z

80

27.1000

1,000

0.3388

27,100.00

2 WEEKS

60CS

1566

SERVINGS

Snack Cracker,WG, Bean and Vegetable - 1-
1.5 oz. All-natural bean and vegetable
flavored wheat snack cracker. To meet a
minimum of 1 bread grain serving for the child
nutrition program. Approximate pack 108/1.2
0z servings per case.

Ship Lot: 100

Darlington Appleways 76300

300,000

Darlington
US FOODS EOM 10 Appleways
76300

5079026

108/1.2 oz

24.3000

2,778

0.2250

67,500.00

3 WEEKS

54

1650

SERVINGS

Dressing, Honey Mustard, Pkg. - Honey
mustard packet of dressing with a sweet
savory honey mustard flavor. Packet size
should be 1.5 ozs. Easy tear pouches. Packed
approximately 60 - 100 packets per case. If
packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 50

No approved brands

150,000

MARZETTI 2/10 NET 30 MARZETTI

81996

60/1.50Z

60

9.0800

2,500

0.1513

22,700.00

2000LBS DELIVERED

2 WEEKS

135

1650

SERVINGS

Dressing, Honey Mustard, Pkg. - Honey
mustard packet of dressing with a sweet
savory honey mustard flavor. Packet size
should be 1.5 ozs. Easy tear pouches. Packed
approximately 60 - 100 packets per case. If
packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 50

No approved brands

150,000

SYSCO MEMPHIS,

LLC NET 14DAYS KEN'S FOODS

KE10278B3

60/1.50Z

60

11.1000

2,500

0.1850

27,750.00

3 weeks

110 cs

1650

SERVINGS

Dressing, Honey Mustard, Pkg. - Honey
mustard packet of dressing with a sweet
savory honey mustard flavor. Packet size
should be 1.5 ozs. Easy tear pouches. Packed
approximately 60 - 100 packets per case. If
packed differently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 50

No approved brands

150,000

Ken's

US FOODS EOM 10 KE1027B3

10

1355197

60/1.5 0z

60

11.3300

2,500

0.1888

28,325.00

3 WEEKS

110




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Dry by the Case

. . Required
Estimated Number of . . . Estimated Cost LEAD TIME Number of
Ni‘:]f)l;r Unit Description (Manlﬁzstr::rveeg‘r?);iinc(?Co de) Cases Bidder ?::?nesr Mamgz::rer > “;?;;Jz?g;z’: Pack Size Pounds per per Nurgfber cg:;ﬁjr EXteng::tTmal Comments FROM ORDER Cases Per
(2019-2020) Case Case Sors (IN WEEKS) Pallet
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 17
Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, SCBE
PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING | will accept an approved
Bi issi That Devi Fi What |
id Submissions That Deviate From What Is | . 0\c\.\1ioNs ReFLECT CURRENT| equal (1) as long as it
Being Requested In The Specifications Below S ALL SHIP LOTS
Will Be Considered A Non A ble Vendor AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE meets the bid ARE IN CASES,
Response THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND specification and (2) :
P! . EVALUATED. tested and approved
through SCBE's Sample
Submission Process.
Asian Orange Sauce- Orange flavored. No MSG, |No approved brands
preservatives, artificial flavors, or high fructose
corn syrup. Bright and appetizing color with a Schreiber
1208 CASE  |sweet & savory taste. Approximate pack size 6/ 2,000 Foods Net 30 Ambrosia 34513 4/1 gal 32 227500 | FTEMixed |4 109 $45,500.00 1 week ]
Sib jugs. International, Pallets
Inc.
Ship Lot: 100
Asian Orange Sauce- Orange flavored. No MSG, |No approved brands
preservatives, artificial flavors, or high fructose
corn syrup. Bright and appetizing color with a
1208 | CASE [sweet & savory taste. Approximate pack size 6/ 2,000 Asian Food NET 30 Red Dragon 93004 6/0.5 Gal 33 $48.0000 | 1,819 $1.4585 | $96,00000 |2PANCtSMINImUM] y ek 60 cases
Sib jugs. Solutions delivery per drop
Ship Lot: 100
Asian Orange Sauce- Orange flavored. No MSG, [No approved brands
preservatives, artificial flavors, or high fructose
corn syrup. Bright and appetizing color with a
1208 | CASE |sweet & savory taste. Approximate pack size 6/ 2,000 Chefs Comer | 34 jays Chefs Comer | opc o171 | & /2 Gallon 325 60.0000 336 1.8462 $120,000.00 45 weeks a8
5lb jugs. Foods Foods Jugs preferred
Ship Lot: 100
Mayonnaise - Lite reduced calorie. Should Duke's 06073
contain no more than 30% of calories from fat, [Ventura 72040
no trans fat. 1 gallon jar with a resealable cap. [American Harvest 155
Approximate Pack: 4/1 gallon per case Duke's
1211 CASE 500 US FOODS EOM 10 06073 1360981 4/1 Gal 33 18.7500 500 0.5682 $9,375.00 3 weeks 48
Ship Lot: 100
Relish, Sweet Pickle - U.S. Grade A, minimum  |Cajun Chef (51000)
drained weight 115 ounces, minimum baume GFS/Bay Valley (12803551393)
163, SYSco
1236 CASE Approximate Pack: 4-1 gallon plastic jars per 300 MEMPHIS, LLC NET 14DAYS CAJUN CHEF 51000 4/1GAL 40 28.9700 300 0.7240 $8,691.00 3 WEEKS 48CS

case.

Ship Lot: 75

11




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Dry by the Case

1301

CASE

Sauce, Soy, Light. Dark reduced sodium soy
sauce.
Approximate pack 4- 1/2 gallon.

Ship Lot: 50

Kikkoman (6732671)
La Choy (27000-53668)

600

Schreiber
Foods
International,
Inc.

Net 30 Ambrosia 33913

4/1 gal

30

14.5000

FTL Mixed
Pallets

0.4833

$8,700.00

1 week

48

1301

CASE

Sauce, Soy, Light. Dark reduced sodium soy
sauce.
Approximate pack 4- 1/2 gallon.

Ship Lot: 50

Kikkoman (6732671)
La Choy (27000-53668)

600

SYsCo
MEMPHIS, LLC

NET 14DAYS LACHOY 27000-53668

1GAL

10

11.7000

1,200

1.1700

$14,040.00

2WEEKS

168CS

1301

CASE

Sauce, Soy, Light. Dark reduced sodium soy
sauce.
Approximate pack 4- 1/2 gallon.

Ship Lot: 50

Kikkoman (6732671)
La Choy (27000-53668)

600

USs FOODS

Kikkoman
00130 per the
vendor

EOM 10 5018395

6/.5 Gal

28.58

37.3600

400

1.3072

$22,416.00

3 weeks

48

1333

CASE

Seasoning, Garden Blend - Seasoning with a
blend of spices and herbs, plus a strong garlic
and onion flavor profile, with dehydrated
vegetables carrots, tomatoes and bell peppers.
Salt-free. No MSG added. Packed 6 containers
per case. If packed diferently, please indicate.

Ship Lot: 150 cases

Trade East

600

US FOODS

Monarch

208522 4501227

EOM 10

190z

1.1875

6.7200

3600

5.6589

$4,032.00

SOLD & PRICED as
one 19 oz container;
packed 6 each per
case. CASE QUANITY
REPRESENTS 600
MASTER CASES OF 6
OR 3600 EACHES.

3 weeks

125

5056

CASE

Pan Release Spray, All Purpose. Made with
vegetabale oils and lecithin. To contain no
water or alcohol. Sodium free, fat free, calorie
free, and cholesterol free. Clear to translucent
in color. No preservatives. Approximate Pack:
6/210z cans per case.

Ship Lot: 50

ConAgra Foods/Pam - 64144-63111
Vegaline - 22021
Monarch - 58108-60461

250

Us FOODS

Monarch

EOM 10 933685

3708278

6/17 Oz

6.375

12.1200

308.82

1.9012

$3,030.00

3 weeks

205

5056

CASE

Pan Release Spray, All Purpose. Made with
vegetabale oils and lecithin. To contain no
water or alcohol. Sodium free, fat free, calorie
free, and cholesterol free. Clear to translucent
in color. No preservatives. Approximate Pack:
6/210z cans per case.

Ship Lot: 50

ConAgra Foods/Pam - 64144-63111
Vegaline - 22021
Monarch - 58108-60461

250

SYSCO
MEMPHIS, LLC

NET 14DAYS CONAGRA 64144-63111

6/1702

6.3

14.2400

250

2.2603

$3,560.00

2 WEEKS

148CS

12




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Canned/Pouched - August - December 2019

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT
CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY
CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Cranberry Sauce, Jellied, Canned. Oregon Trail 4171261000
Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6/#10 |Clement 232079
Cans per case. GFS/Clement 0100610 SYsco 0100610SYSIMP-
1295 CASE 600 1ET 14DAYS | SYSCO IMPERIAL 6/#10 32.0000 600 19,200.00 2 WEEKS 56CS
Ocean Spray 01400 MEMPHIS, LLC 5729967 / $
Ship Lot: 200 Sysco Imperial 5729967
Cranberry Sauce, Jellied, Canned. Oregon Trail 4171261000
Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6/#10 |Clement 232079
Cans per case. GFS/Clement 0100610
CHURCHFIELD 1/2%
1295 CASE Ocean Spray 01400 600 TRADING 10£ET30 OREGON TRAIL 4171261000 6/ #10 34.0500 600 $20,430.00 2 56
Ship Lot: 200 Sysco Imperial 5729967

13



Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)
2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid
Refrigerated

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.
ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY
CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Cheese Stick, Marble, IW - Made with 100% cheese. Bongard's 40220
ivi pped. Minimum serving weight equal to 1oz.
Each serving must be a minimum 1oz equivalent M/MA per

child nutrition guidelines. Approximate Pack: 100/10z

1844 SERVINGS 250,000 SSCO ’I:';MPHIS’ NET 14 DAYS | BONGARD 40293 40293 168/10Z 1489 31.9000 168 5,355.94 2 WEEKS 126CS
Ship Lot: 200
Cheese Stick, Marble, IW - Made with 100% cheese. Bongard's 40220

Individually-wrapped. Minimum serving weight equal to 10z.
Each serving must be a minimum 1oz equivalent M/MA per

child nutrition guidelines. Approximate Pack: 100/10z S
1844 SERVINGS 250,000 US FOODS EOM 10 44877 6664767 168/1 0z 168 34.1800 1,488 3.2552 50,863.10 3 weeks 120

Ship Lot: 200

Potato Salad, Bulk - Potato salad with mayonnaise, |St. Clair Steakhouse 101006
mustard, onions sweet pickle relish, celery,
pimentos and spices. Potatoes should be cubed no
larger than 1/2". Packed 2/12 Ib resealable tubs.

St. Clair

1870 SERVINGS Serving size equals 1/2 cup. Approximate Pack: 90 18,000 US FOODS EOM 10 101006 2400604 2/1218 90 27.6800 200 1.1533 5,536.00 3 weeks 50
servings per case.

Ship Lot: 10 cases

14



Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid

Supplies
. . LEAD TIME
Estimated Estimated
Stock . . . . Product . Cost per Extended FROM
Number gfguznol; Unit Description Vendor Brand Code Pack Size Nucr:r;zirsof Unit Total Cost NOTES ORDER
(IN WEEKS)
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13
Items listed are Pre-
Bid Submissions That Deviate From PACK SIZES FOR THE vAv:)Ir;:::’::tzr: :(:):’:)525
What Is Being Requested In The FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS equal (1) as long as it
e L. ) REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS. X
Specifications Below Will Be meets the bid
Considered A Non Acceptable ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE specification and (2)
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED
Vendor Response. tested and approved
AND EVALUATED.
through SCBE's Sample
Submission Process.
SUPER LUNCH SACKS WITH LOGO. |[MinMor S45059
250 SACKS PER PACKAGE. MinMor S44000
DIMENSIONS: HEIGHT 11 1/4 MinMor S33666
INCHES WIDTH 6 INCHES DEPTH 3
1/2 INCHES. SPECIFY IF PACKED
5050 1000 CASE |DIFFERENTLY. IF NOT BIDDING AN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPROVED BRAND SAMPLES MUST
BE SUBMITTED PRIOR TO BID
OPENING.
SHIP LOT: 250
Apron, Black Cloth - Bib polyester  |Champion
cotton blend, with no ironing
required. Apron sized "one size fits
all." Washable. Approximately 32- SAME PRODUCT FROM
5055 1600 CASE 43 " in length and approximately 29" BID 2565 48 34 6.7500 $10,800.00 2 WEEKS
in width.
Ship Lot: 500
Apron, Black Cloth - Bib polyester |Champion
cotton blend, with no ironing
required. Apron sized "one size fits
all." Washable. Approximately 32- SUPERIOR
5055 1600 CASE 43 " in length and approximately 29" BIABKU 2948115 1EA 1600 7.2700 $11,632.00 3 weeks

in width.

Ship Lot: 500




Shelby County Board of Education (SCBE)

2019-2020 SY
Miscellaneous Bid

Supplies

5061

1,800

CASE

Hand Soap - Premium Foam
antibacterial hand wash. Eradicates
germs with a rich lather. Soap type
should be liquid. Approximately 7.5
0z pump bottle. Packed
approximately 6 bottles per case.

Iltems must be accompanied by the
Safety Data Sheet (SDS).

SHIP LOT: 200

No Approved Brands

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

5084

5000

CASE

PLATE, DISPOSABLE, 10 INCH, 3-
COMPARTMENT. BLACK,
STYROFOAM, SOAK THROUGH
RESISTANT OR OTHER ACCEPTABLE
PROCESSING TO ADD RIGIDITY AND
RESIST GREASE, MOISTURE
ABSORPTION AND LEAKS.
APPROXIMATE PACK: 500 PLATES
PER CASE.

SHIP LOT: 300

No Approved Brands

Dart
10CPBQR

2972115

4/125 EA

5000

29.2000

$146,000.00

3 weeks

5084

5000

CASE

PLATE, DISPOSABLE, 10 INCH, 3-
COMPARTMENT. BLACK,
STYROFOAM, SOAK THROUGH
RESISTANT OR OTHER ACCEPTABLE
PROCESSING TO ADD RIGIDITY AND
RESIST GREASE, MOISTURE
ABSORPTION AND LEAKS.
APPROXIMATE PACK: 500 PLATES
PER CASE.

SHIP LOT: 300

No Approved Brands

DART

10CPBQR

500

5000

29.7400

$148,700.00

3 WEEKS




1 Champion Awards, Inc.

2 Schreiber Foods International, Inc.

3 Side Dish 5
4 M.C.I. Foods, Inc.
5 Conagra Brands, Inc.
6 Hadley Farms, Inc.
7 J. R. Simplot Company
8 Eddy Packaging Company, Inc.
9 Simco Foods
10 Pilgrim's Pride Corp.
11 Churchfield Trading
12 McKee Foods Corporation
13 Global Foods Inc.
14 T. Marzetti Company
15 Tyson Foods Inc.
16 Chef's Corner Foods
17 National Food Group
18 Bake Crafters Food Company
19 Jennie-0 Turkey Store
20 US Foods
21 ES Foods
22 Cargill Meat Solutions
23 Sysco Memphis, LLC

Chinese Food Solutions, Inc. dba Asian

24 Food Solutions / Comida Vida

Patrick Brown
Valerie Cabrales
Norman Jones
Dan Southard
Chuck Gentile
Deborah Howard
Becky Fox
Gayle Jones
David Sims
Karen Cobb
Mikki Robinson
Deris Bagli
Dawn Ramos
Miller McDonald
Charles Boger
Jim Chlor

Tara Sharpe
Cliff Coggins
Rick Schwantes
Jimmy Green
Olivia Kan
Valerie McCoy
Debbie Bolton

Allan Lam

(901) 365-4830
(800) 631-7070
(310) 272-0967
(562) 977-4000
(937) 440-2959
(301) 824-2558
(208) 780-8482
(361) 293-2361
(310) 284-8446
(970) 506-8348
(805) 693-5007
(423) 238-7111
(702) 212-4543
(919) 738-0204
(479) 290-3519
(510) 441-0565
(248) 560-2333
(423) 443-4233
(320) 231-7175
(501) 412-5821
(516) 682-5494
(502) 415-3421
(901) 367-7613

(888) 499-6888

pbrown@championpromotion.com

vcabrales@ambrosia-foods.com
normanjones@sidedish5.com
dan@mcifoods.com
chuck.gentile@conagra.com
chall@hadleyfarms.com
becky.fox@simplot.com
gjiones@eddypacking.com
bid@simco.us
goldkist@pilgrims.com
mikki@churchfieldtrading.com
foodservice@mckee.com
dawnr@globalfoodslv.com
mmcdonald@marzetti.com
k12bidgroup@tyson.com
BIDS@chefscornerfoods.com
ngoetz@nationalfoodgroup.com
cliff@bakecrafters.com
rlschwantes@j-ofs.com
jimmy.green@usfoods.com
bids@esfoods.com
valerie_mccoy@cargill.com
boltondebbie@mem.sysco.com

bids@asianfoodsolutions.com
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